Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KI/TV(N)/634/2018-20

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2020

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2020 ©MaTQo6nid 29
Aello § 92150y 29th September 2020
o CIS; 1196 &av/] 13 m“,\’f? 2220
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 13th Kanni 1196
Tuesday 1942 @Ry wilmo 7
7th Aswina 1942
GHh 03 MVAINID
oo (Moo dldmoem-adl) Aldsa]
Qlle6rmialmo
NI 9559/0e1u3.m12/2020/l@ao. @030, 2020 &AVaiRo6 1 28
1196 &aml 12

1942 @voilmo 6.

2020 &MValgoenid 26-00 GID  EHO8  VWAUBNAD  AllBoeNINeY|SIOTTI®
@AY  olO)M  BBWIMMIT  &alom|mMeEnses  @nolallerlssnr]l  @IMNoad

QYNNG UNE

NAIBERROIOS 2OMOQIMB (18000,

@pollos enioenly all. &&s.,
Ml 6V S50l

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2020-e£1 65-00 MNIA 633NN

2020-0£1 608 DM, 033QUSS], MY H@I¥1e108] 8BHUAMIW] (6BEWTI)

a303Wlnammy

0™ OloJeRlesllon ag)$lalBlIOIMIo TMVLAICNOOHIT BHO8 NAUABENA

aflgoenioee SO ©).

1998-6e1 608 DVQ, 3$0530188], MY OIS BEUNMIW] GB:]

6RAV®I SalgpmM @I es
&30}
s30dalnadny

aflole,.—2020-0e1 808 D, $0530I88], MY 6®I¥1e108] sHaMIW] (6REL®)

edlmmmy  (2020-0e1  37) 2020 wmeeel 3-00 GO 6HO8  NAIBENA
aflgoenioeq]sioml@lo}malmoelo;

2020 @Y 2400 OOl G2UBMM  GHOS  TVoMNOM  MIWATVEIHS
MLCIASMNBILIOD (EITIM® 630AAIMMAVINT ald0o MVoNIM MIWAMVEIHS G0}
@B ©30NUM@IM88 &0} il MleamEDI® @RIl lesnmalmgo
aIOROBNM Mo BSl@IBlOM @IMmoelo;

ROOMOMIHE BOEMALISM@NS 213-00 @OMB5JGo (2)-00 eU6MWo (ag)) Daleemb

@000 @I  &3Wlmmmilay 2020 &66NIA  5-00 @I (@loenielio
LMDV 0}@AM@IMIL0;

E@Vm®  adallmmdadleel  alQINGWd  MlemBemIdTIOlealm  alddHo
06 0IaHAIEERUD HENIIBIOAM BIMILI0;

BHO8 MoMNIM MIATVE TVEIASMOBILILIOMBIMOLI0 @I TVM|O MSals]
a)S}CHOMD® @RYQIUDIMIGBIIN  TVIaN210568BUd Milelaileneenzam 6608 NAIBENAHS)
@6NI0RLIMIDIBlBNM @IMIEI0;

DG |0U8, @P@IMO@, BIOOOTIONG BOMARISM@ES 213-0, @PMBaIG0 (1)-00
QUEMW@ 100  M@He]s  @oWlB00630d  alldleouls] 608  wWaIdeAE
@969 0@ SAWIMMMY Qil80enIne)e |SIoYmIIMi—

1. 2O)HOEa |0l (01000BAI0.—(1) 0D a308Wlmnmailay 2020-6.1 CH08 DY,
2035188], ®¢ 6®o¥1e108] MWl (¢RI oBUIMAMY ag)m Gald alOIo.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) oo® 2020 2ol 30 OO (@OMIEKOIT UM
B 0}ME]ESEBMOIEI.

2. 1998ee1 170, @] ®IRL0elen0]  6EEOMI 6.0 BSENZMET.—
v godlmmday milelailelldleaym &oeio® 1998-081 8HO8  WOQ, BOSIAUSS,
@9 6®%le08l eundilul  EHGIT (1998-ee1 17) (D@IMBUDH @IWIM GYBY

ag)IMI6NM 2 l00DAUTIBOe|S)E) 3-00 QAU fl@ 1000dUTlajldleeymm GRRUNMIBUdHE)
aillew@mo@] (@ Ioenielmienzoldlasnam@oem).

3. 4-00 QI lN88 BEREBUVMI.—(@IWIM BYBQIOL! 4-00 QB {lEd,—

(1) (D-00 QalBY @ “EIBIROTVo o@¥ ©3atd Afldo” ag) QIB6B:0BH6)
ald0o “E@IM@OMo al@INe@I 0}ald Aflmo” ag)M QUOBOGUD BaIBBHHENIMILENT;

(2)  (2)-00 DalQIBR[@ “@06OO MOAMVAN0 @S Olal” oM AUILENEUBLE)
ald0o “60600 MMV al®IME®T OJalt” a0 QAUIBENGUD CalBCLHENZMIGN);

(3) (3)-00 DalQIBfl@ “80600 MOAVALE oY ol Qfl@0” ag)IN AUDBENEUBHE)
ald0o “&0600 MMV al®IMer®] ot Afl®o” ag)M QAUOBEG:UD C2IBBHLHENIMI6NT;

(4) @-00 2010 @  “@OoUIRIVOMIAT CREIMOV RO} @” o)
QUOBNBUBHE) aldh®o “BoUIRIROMING af)9alOBlera] LOMAIMOMIM GIEIMOW
OS> af)IM QAUIENBHUD BalBCHNENBMI6).

4. 0398010 @$101086e10—(1) 2020-081 GHO8 MY, B05QUSS], O H@IYIRINS
eaHnMIWl (6cRV®I) sodaWlmmmS (2020-ee!1 37) @M@ 03oes I dlesa;am;.

(2) @OsEROM 0308SIOIMIMBOMHM@Y0, EINIO® BIBAWIMNMMY (@ 18000
6RO 521Qea]g (IWOM BYBIVBBIFITD 621V oBO®ESIEI0 HOOIEAI 2g)SIOD
oBOOBIIERe MSalSle@d D B3BAUIMMBM (@I000  BRRVMI ©21Qea]s (IWIM
@BGWVHISITD ©.21DD@ICI 2f)S}MDDMICWI HO}ME)|BSENZGIEN).

@ROlaly MOME 600D,
DQUCGPD.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No. 9559/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 28th September, 2020

12th Kanni, 1196
6th Aswina, 1942.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (65 of 2020).

By order of the Governor,

ARAVINTHA BABU P. K.,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2020-ee1 6608 0, 050188l @¢ emIslens]
eHamIW] (6cEL®I) @adIMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 65 OF 2020

THE KERALA BAMBOO, KATTUVALLI AND PANDANUS LEAF WORKERS’
WELFARE FUND (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers® Welfare Fund Act, 1998.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’
Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (37 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor
of Kerala on the 3rd day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session which convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India, the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 5th day of October, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala Bamboo,
Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 3rd day of July, 2020.

2. Act 17 of 1998 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act,
1998 (17 of 1998) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the

amendments specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 4—1In the principal Act, in section 4,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “seven rupees per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees per month” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words

“fifteen rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (4), for the words “an amount equal to the amount contributed”,
the words “an amount equal to the seventy five percentage of the amount contributed” shall

be substituted.

b

4. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers
Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (37 of 2020) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the principal
Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the

principal Act as amended by this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202 Digitally signed by Salim A

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette. Date:2020.09.29 09:27:30 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




		2020-09-29T21:27:30+0530
	Salim A




