Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KI/TV(N)/634/2018-20

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2020

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 QUMD a0, 2020 R)e60!1 30
30th July 2020
U (O0%o _—
?/D'Ia'cls;g J 1195 &8OS0 15 m“,\’fc? 1740
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 15th Karkadakam 1195
Thursday 1942 (®OQ6Mo 8
8th Sravana 1942
GHh 03 MAINID
oo (Pl dldmoem-adl) Aldsa]
Qlle6rmialmo
MMId 7733/6e105.a812/2020/Ml@ao. @lgoInama oo, 2020 eyeeel 30

1195 5@H6SHo 15
1942 woonierno 8.

2020 2306e1 29-00 W] 6HO8 NAIRERNA Qil80NI06)e |SIOMWI @IS IO

&3IMMM aldmERMEBRReS @0INIERIEe W] H@MIMIM (INIELE S},

WAIRERRNIOS 2OMOQIIMB (01000,

@poallas enioenyy all. &&s.,
Ml 6VEeS0l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2020-9e1 42-20 MMIA 6323l

2020-9£1 6HO8 HalN}dls 6MIFo dOMISIENS] chHamIwl
(ceaum]) aa3aulmmdm’

0™ OloJeRlesllon ag)$lel@BIOIMIo  MVLAICTLOCTHIT BH08 WAUABGNA

aflgoenioee SO ©).

2008-6)£1 BHHOB 6210}B5lS BMIF0 OMO¥IRINE] UMW @DEY

6RAVDI aIgRMOIMI8s
&0}
a303lonad S

aflole,.—2008-0e1 GHO8 6210BIS 6MIF0 OMISIENS] cHHUAMIW]  CVEY
(2008-0e1 17) ©®IO9|O@IAM  BDAUUDIBRUBBHODI]  aflensle GEREVGI  ©2IQMOY

QBRI 0lE6HILN0;

GHO8 MLoMUOOM  MIAMVE  AVEMASMOMILIPOOD@IMILR @I VIO
MNSalSIOWSIBHNMEDT  @YAUUDIMISMN  MIa0alOEERUd  mlelaileeemmy 6508

NQIRERABHS BeNIOELINODIBlBNM@IMOLI}0;

06000, @OIMIM, ERIOMOWIOG  BOEMALISM@ES  213-00  BOMYG4IG0

(1)-00 QUEMWEIBIV0 M@He)]3 @PWI0068300 AllMleoUils)], 608 WaIdeRA

@969 |0 SBAWIMMY Qil80enI06)e |SIOYmIIMI—

1. 210366800 (11900RA0.—(1) D sodaullmmadlay 2020-6e1 608 6.2103w]S

8IS0 6®2¥1e108] eaHamilull (6BRLWMI) 830BAIMMMY ag)MY Gald alO@o.
(2) OO 9SB (@I2NILIODIT QIOIMIE).

2. 20080r! 170, @BQ ®IMVEHRIHNIDV] RN 6)2KQEe (SN —EDD

a303llinmday mleailelldleaimm @:0e1or), 2008-0£1 08 5210iBlS BMISo HMISIEIOE]

v v

eaUnMIW] @Gl (2008-0e1 17) (DOGIMIGUDHo  @EIWOM  @BBY  agYTNOET

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




al00nABUTkEeR|SKB,) 300 QA3 QIwmNIBsIdleanm 6EELMIGW@S allewnow]

(@1oenIelmIeN30lBleaM 6.

3. 5-00 QI {1008 GRRUOM].—@IWIM @GB! 5-00 Qlds)a |@d,—

() (1)-00 Qalidlafl@d “mgl OJI@ ©at” a)IM QIOBNEUWVSBE) ald:00

“mMQl ag)eMal® 0al” ad)a QUOBNGUD GalBGHSENRMOET);

(i) (2)-00 Dol fl@ “MGl WDOI® Ot )TN AUIBNGHUDBE ald:00o

“mMQl ag)eMal® 0al” ad)aN QIOBNGUD GalBEHSENRMOET);

(iii) (3)-00 DalQIBY{l@B “OOIMIGI MI@De @} BYalt” ag)(D QAUIBE}BUBHE) ald:0o

“mamQl @0JIB Oal” ag)M QUIBN}GUD BalQBLEENBMIET).

@0lal Ma0MAE 61000,
DQICPE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No.7733/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 30th July, 2020

15th Karkadakam,1195
8th Sravana, 1942.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 (42 of 2020).

By order of the Governor,

ARAVINTHA BABUP. K.,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2020-0£1 6508 ©.410}&ls 6®250 O8] ceunmlwl
(eeeL®]) a303aImadaS” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 42 OF 2020

THE KERALA SMALL PLANTATION WORKERS’ WELFARE FUND
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India.
AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 2008.

Preamble—WHEREAS, it is expedient to amend the Kerala Small Plantation Workers'

Welfare Fund Act, 2008 (17 of 2008) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala Small

Plantation Workers' Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Act 17 of 2008 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund Act, 2008 (17 of 2008)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments

specified in section 3.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




3. Amendment of section 5.—In the principal Act, in section 5,—
(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words
“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words

“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1i1)) in sub-section (3), for the words “two hundred and forty rupees”, the words

“three hundred and sixty rupees” shall be substituted.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202@s:

o4

Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette. Date:2020.07.30 04:21:02 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/



		2020-07-30T16:21:02+0530
	Salim A




